
 
Raleigh Seventh-day Adventist Church  

                          
                                                  March 15, 2025 
 

                                        Sabbath School 9:30 - 10:30 a.m. 
 

                                 Adult Classes: Fellowship Hall & Sanctuary 
                                          Children Classes by Age in Classroom 
 

                                                Divine Worship Hour 10:45 a.m. 

 

 

 
  Song Service                                                                        Meghan Smith 
 

  Welcome & Announcements                                          Elder Brian Heard       

  Praise & Exaltation   

  Call to Worship                                             “Turn Your Eyes Upon Jesus” 

  Invocation                                                                      Dr. Bill Underwood 

  Opening Song                                 #524   ‘Tis So Sweet to Trust in Jesus 

  Children’s Story                                                                     Rosetta Smith 

  Tithes & Offering              Local Church Budget             Elder Brian Heard 
                                             
  Congregational Prayer                                                    Elder Brain Heard 
 

  Prayer Song Response                                                          Congregation 

  Scripture Reading                 Matthew 26:36-39            Elder Brian Heard 
     
  Special Music                                                                       Meghan Smith 
   
  Sermon                   “The Power of Prayer”                Dr. Bill Underwood 
                                   
  Closing Song                               #499   What a Friend We Have in Jesus  
 
  Benediction                                                                   Dr. Bill Underwood 
   
  Pianist*                                                                                  Robert Nelson 

                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                     

                                   Welcome & Announcements 
 
Welcome:  A special welcome this morning to everyone and especially to our 
guests. Thank you for worshipping with us.  May you be richly blessed and 
join us as often as you can.  If you have special prayer requests, would like to 
speak with the pastor, or have questions about our church speak with one of 
us following the service and we will be delighted to assist you. 
 
Zoom Prayer Meeting:  Join us Wednesdays at 7:00 for prayer, praise, and 
study in God’s Word. 
 
Baptism:  Next Sabbath will be a special day as Willie Brooks will proclaim his 
love for Jesus through baptism. 
 
Membership Transfer Requests:  First reading for: Lorie Topham from Raleigh 
to Fletcher SDA Church in Hendersonville, NC & first reading for Leah Deweez 
Wells from Raleigh to Madison SDA Church in Madison, TN. 
 
Fellowship Meal:  All are invited to join us for good food and Christian fellowship 
following the worship service today. 
 

  Children’s Choir:  There will be a practice today following the church service in 
preparation for their first performance the following week, March 22.  See 
Meghan Smith or Enesha Williams for details. 

 
  Festival of Faith:  Please mark your calendar for this special weekend, March 
28 & 29 celebrating 130 years of Adventism in Memphis!  Dr. Joe Kidder of 
Andrews University will be our guest speaker.  Friday night and Saturday services 
will be at Memphis 1st SDA Church. 
 

  MAA Worthy Student Assistance Commitment:  Raleigh Church commitment 
is $1,700 per month for the 2024/2025 school year. Thank you for your ongoing 
faithfulness toward Adventist Christian Education. 
 
Remember you can easily give your tithe and church offerings online at 
adventistgiving.org  

                                          Upcoming Schedule 
 
Sunset                                                                 Today 7:08   Next Friday 7:13 
Wednesday                                                      Zoom Prayer Meeting 7:00 p.m.  
Speaker Next Sabbath                                                          Pastor Mike Burks 
March 28 & 29         Festival of Faith Weekend        Services at Memphis First 
 

                                                     Prayer Request 
 

Delores Cathey  Rachel Maynard       Louis Plueger       Highland Academy 
Derrick Kirkwood      Lanier Thorne           MAA                     Memphis Outreach Min. 

 


